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Motivation 
Modern contraception allows women to control the timing and number of their pregnancies. Delayed 
childbirth and spaced pregnancies have well-established health, social and economic benefits.i 
However, nearly 25% of women in low-income countries who want to avoid pregnancy are not using 
modern contraception, with this figure being over 60% for adolescent girls.ii While some of the unmet 
need for family planning is driven by limited health infrastructure, many women who have access to 
providers still fail to receive methods that fit their needs.iii This suggests that understanding provider 
decision-making around contraception provision may be crucial to increasing access to modern 
methods.  
 
The fact that young girls have the most egregious unmet need for contraception suggests that age 
could be a key driver of provider bias. However, adolescents are often both unmarried and/or 
nulliparous, and therefore it is difficult to separate the effect of age from the effect of marital status 
and parity. Prior literature has used a variety of approaches to measure provider bias, but none have 
been able to isolate the role of individual client attributes.iv  
 
This study disentangles the effect of age, marital status, and parity through a discrete choice 
experiment (DCE) with providers in Burkina Faso, Tanzania and Pakistan. 
 
Data 
We use data from a provider survey and a DCE of 811 providers across three different countries: 
Burkina Faso (n=310), Tanzania (n=301), and Pakistan (n=200). The provider survey elicited self-
reported information about how providers engage with youth in their practice as well as their attitudes 
about the appropriateness of providing family planning counseling to youth clients. The DCE asked 
about attitudes, beliefs and practices indirectly. The DCE approach presented client vignettes to 
providers that randomly varied the age, parity and marital status of the client. Providers were then 
asked about how they would counsel these hypothetical clients on family planning methods. 
 
Methods 
We used the DCE to isolate the effect of client age, marital status, and parity on provider decision-
making around family planning counseling. For a given client profile, behaviors of interest are the 
decision to decline counseling altogether or to deny modern methods. Attitudes of interest are whether 
or not providers think IUDs are inappropriate and whether providers would hesitate to provide 
counseling on IUDs. We analyzed each binary outcome using logistic regression with standard errors 
clustered at the provider level. All analyses were stratified by country. 
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Findings 
We found that there is notable variation across countries in the characteristics that influence provider 
decisions to provide contraception and in the size of the effect. Table 2 provides country-level 
averages for all outcome variables. For instance, nearly all providers in Burkina Faso would provide 
some counseling, while half of Pakistani providers would decline counseling based on client 
characteristics. Bias is most visible in Pakistan where providers were more likely to exhibit biased 
behaviors and beliefs to both nulliparous and unmarried women. Bias was subtler in Tanzania and 
Burkina Faso and was mostly driven by attitudes towards nulliparous women.  
 
Figure 1 shows the impact of age, marital status, and parity in a provider’s decision of whether or not 
to provide counseling. Looking at the Pakistan panel, we see no differential decision-making based on 
client age. By contrast, Pakistani providers are 55 percentage points more likely to decline counseling 
to married women compared to unmarried women. As compared to clients with at least 2 children, 
Pakistani providers were 35 percentage points more likely to decline counseling to nulliparous women. 
Figures 2-4 show the impact of age, marital status, and parity on denial of modern methods, belief 
about inappropriateness of IUDs, and hesitation to counsel on modern methods across all three 
countries. 
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